
Subject: Re: WTC BID Invoice for Assessment Funds
From: Donald Duckworth <duckworth.donald@gmail.com>
Date: 09/03/2013 12:30 PM
To: Emelia Tso <emelia.tso@lacity.org>

Thanks Emelia.  Elsie will deliver the original to you this afternoon.  I've added
the additional amount.   

On Tue, Sep 3, 2013 at 7:38 AM, Emelia Tso <emelia.tso@lacity.org> wrote:
Hi Don,

The attached invoice is fine.  However, please also note that the attached
transmittal is also available for your reimbursement.  Thanks.

Emelia

---------- Forwarded message ----------
From: Donald Duckworth <duckworth.donald@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, Sep 2, 2013 at 4:41 PM
Subject: WTC BID Invoice for Assessment Funds
To: Emelia Tso <emelia.tso@lacity.org>

Good Morning Emelia...

Attached is an invoice for assessment funds from the Westchester Town Center
BID.  If you'll verify it, I'll have the original hand delivered to you. 

Thanks.

--

Thanks.

Emelia Tso
Administrative Service Division
Office of City Clerk
213-978-1110
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